Bid No. 20066
Title: Aftermarket Auto Parts
Due Date: 2/13/2020 @ 3 PM

COUNTY OF PLACER, AUBURN, CA
BID TABULATION & AWARD RECOMMENDATION

Buyer Name/Phone:

Jon Manning

(Recommended award is highlighted)

530-889-4242

Name of Firm
City/State

Contact Person
Telephone
Email

Procurement Cards?

Restocking Policy

Delivery Time

Retail Locations

Factory Motor Parts

Sacramento, CA
Dana Carney

720-251-1776

d.carney@fmpco.com

Yes

Stocking customers can return up to 12
months without the restocking fee -
after 12 months 15% fee

Auburn - 4 hours; Truckee - Next Day

Yes; Rocklin

Riebes Auto Parts
Auburn, CA

Paul Gerstle
916-251-5402

aul_gerstle@riebes.com

Yes

No Restocking Fee on regular stocking
items in resellable condition. There
could be a small restocking fee on

Special Orders depending on the
vendor the part was sourced from.

1 Hour

Yes; Auburn, Colfax, Rocklin, Loomis,
and Lincoln

O'Reilly Auto Parts
Springfield, MO

Roanen Barron
417-829-5879
probids@oreillyauto.com

Yes

No restocking fee for items returned
unused, undamaged, in original
packaging, and in resellable condition.
Otherwise a restocking fee of 20% may
apply at Store Manager's discretion.

Most in-stock items within 1 day, most
non-stock items within 1-2 days,
special/factory orders by appointments

Yes; Auburn, Rocklin, Roseville,
Lincoln

Discounts for Other Aftermarket Auto Parts? Yes - See Attached NO Yes
LVP Certified? No Yes No
Invoice Terms * Net 30 2% Net 10 2% 10, Net 20
I;E\lecr:.1 Item Description Qty Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension

1 |WIX33416 Spi”'ofﬂt';e'/water separator| 4, 24.86 1,740.20 26.16 1,831.20 39.25 2,747.50
Brand and Model Offered: As specified NAPA 3416 As specified

2 | WIX49666 Corrugated style air filter | 45 3046 | 177570 153 | 186885 6230 | 280350
Brand and Model Offered: As specified NAPA 9666 As specified

3 WIX 46644 Air filter 35 3013 | 105455 stz | 111020 a5t | 166495
Brand and Model Offered: As specified NAPA 6644 As specified

4 Ch%”;g:::sﬁzr%c;ﬁi; . g;f,{,{:ice 15 NO BID 89.99 1,349.85 99.49 1492.35
Brand and Model Offered: XXXXX As specified As specified

5 Pe?;kog:ﬁbﬁ:ﬁ;@i;ﬁ?&nggg /28/50 80 14.77 1,181.60 8.98 718.40 15.99 1,279.20
Brand and Model Offered: BECK 252-1502 PEAK FCAB53 As specified

Peak Fleet Charge SCA Precharged 1
6 Gallon Pink Concentrate 30 NO BID 10.99 329.70 17.99 539.70
Coolant/Antifreeze #FLEET

Brand and Model Offered: XXXXX PEAK #AFFLEET As specified

7 | WIX 49560 Corrugated style secondary | 23.19 695.70 24.41 732.30 36.61 1,098.30

air filter

Brand and Model Offered: As specified NAPA 9560 As specified

8 WIX 42491 Air filter 20 30.91 618.20 32.53 650.60 48.80 976.00
Brand and Model Offered: As specified NAPA 2491 As specified

9 Krygtglegizr l\:/vfirr;‘liiep'gixl/?jhg;mid | 370 1.56 577.20 1.69 625.30 2.79 1,032.30
Brand and Model Offered: FOX SPLASHWASH XTREME BLUE 32617 As specified
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Name of Firm
City/State

Contact Person
Telephone
Email

Procurement Cards?

Restocking Policy

Delivery Time

Retail Locations

Factory Motor Parts

Sacramento, CA

Dana Carney
720-251-1776

d.carney@fmpco.com

Yes

Stocking customers can return up to 12
months without the restocking fee -
after 12 months 15% fee

Auburn - 4 hours; Truckee - Next Day

Yes; Rocklin

Riebes Auto Parts
Auburn, CA

Paul Gerstle
916-251-5402

aul_gerstle@riebes.com

Yes

No Restocking Fee on regular stocking
items in resellable condition. There
could be a small restocking fee on

Special Orders depending on the
vendor the part was sourced from.

1 Hour

Yes; Auburn, Colfax, Rocklin, Loomis,
and Lincoln

O'Reilly Auto Parts
Springfield, MO

Roanen Barron
417-829-5879
probids@oreillyauto.com

Yes

No restocking fee for items returned
unused, undamaged, in original
packaging, and in resellable condition.
Otherwise a restocking fee of 20% may
apply at Store Manager's discretion.

Most in-stock items within 1 day, most
non-stock items within 1-2 days,
special/factory orders by appointments

Yes; Auburn, Rocklin, Roseville,
Lincoln

Discounts for Other Aftermarket Auto Parts? Yes - See Attached NO Yes
LVP Certified? (" No Yes No
Invoice Terms Net 30 2% Net 10 2% 10, Net 20
Item
No. Item Description Qty Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension
Precision Control Arm and Ball Joint
10 Assembly #8CB50053 5 70.39 351.95 97.75 488.75 157.57 787.85
Brand and Model Offered: MOOG RK620054 MOOG CK620054 As specified
14 oz. CARB Compliant Brake Parts
1 Cleaner, ORC #46580, must meet 305 1.87 570.35 2.99 911.95 2.99 911.95
California VOC requirements
Brand and Model Offered: FVP CC50ST11 CRC 095050 As specified
12 WIX 24314 Cabin air panel (filter) 25 18.73 468.25 19.72 493.00 29.57 739.25
Brand and Model Offered: As specified NAPA 4314 As specified
13 |WIX 33604 Sp'”'(}ﬂt‘;“rev water separator| 4 15.79 473.70 16.62 498.60 24.92 747.60
Brand and Model Offered: As specified NAPA 3604 As specified
Gates FleetRunner Micro-V Serpentine
14 Belt, #K080514HD 10 35.58 355.80 52.64 526.40 54.04 540.40
Brand and Model Offered: CONTINENTAL 4080515 NAPA GATES 25-080514HD As specified
15 | TRICOHD 26 'n%;/v'per Blade, #67- | 55 5.88 147.00 24.99 624.75 22.01 550.25
Brand and Model Offered: SPLASH 700526 NAPA TRICO 6-2656 As specified
Sylvania #H4656 Basic Sealed Beam
16 Headlight Bulb (Pack of 1) 70 7.60 532.00 7.49 524.30 5.53 387.10
Brand and Model Offered: WAGNER H4656 As specified As specified
Peak Blue DEF Diesel Exhaust Fluid,
17 2.5 gallon container, #DEF002 135 7.60 1,026.00 8.99 1,213.65 15.99 2,158.65
Brand and Model Offered: FVP DEF25GAL As specified As specified
18 WIX 46476 Radial seal outer air filter 10 24.00 240.00 25.27 252.70 37.90 379.00
Brand and Model Offered: As specified NAPA 6476 As specified
Gates FleetRunner Micro-V Serpentine
19 Belt, #K080675HD 5 38.90 194.50 53.87 269.35 55.28 276.40
Brand and Model Offered: CONTINENTAL 4080675 NAPA GATES 25-080675HD As specified
o0 | RainGuard 22 Inczhnglper Blade, #29- | 45 5.34 186.90 12.56 439.60 9.99 349.65
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Name of Firm
City/State

Contact Person

Telephone
Email

Procurement Cards?

Restocking Policy

Delivery Time

Factory Motor Parts

Sacramento, CA

Dana Carney
720-251-1776

d.carney@fmpco.com

Yes

Stocking customers can return up to 12
months without the restocking fee -
after 12 months 15% fee

Auburn - 4 hours; Truckee - Next Day

Riebes Auto Parts
Auburn, CA

Paul Gerstle
916-251-5402
aul

erstle@riebes.com

Yes

No Restocking Fee on regular stocking
items in resellable condition. There
could be a small restocking fee on

Special Orders depending on the
vendor the part was sourced from.

1 Hour

Yes; Auburn, Colfax, Rocklin, Loomis,

O'Reilly Auto Parts
Springfield, MO

Roanen Barron
417-829-5879
probids@oreillyauto.com

Yes

No restocking fee for items returned
unused, undamaged, in original
packaging, and in resellable condition.
Otherwise a restocking fee of 20% may
apply at Store Manager's discretion.

Most in-stock items within 1 day, most
non-stock items within 1-2 days,
special/factory orders by appointments

Yes; Auburn, Rocklin, Roseville,

Retail Locations Yes; Rocklin . .
and Lincoln Lincoln
Discounts for Other Aftermarket Auto Parts? Yes - See Attached NO Yes
LVP Certified? ") No Yes No
Invoice Terms Net 30 2% Net 10 2% 10, Net 20
Item
No. Item Description Qty Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension
Brand and Model Offered: SPLASH 700522 NAPA/TRICO 6-022-1B As specified
21 WIX 46883 Air filter 5 31.31 156.55 32.96 164.80 49.43 24715
Brand and Model Offered: As specified NAPA 6883 As specified
OIL-DRI Absorbent Roll, Universal,
22 Gray, 30" W x 150 ft. L roll, #.90540 5 97.30 486.50 149.00 745.00 141.99 709.95
Brand and Model Offered: As specified NEW PIG #BKMAT30150UM As specified
Gates FleetRunner Micro-V Serpentine
23 Belt, #K080496HD 5 31.89 159.45 44.35 221.75 45.99 229.95
Brand and Model Offered: CONTINENTAL 4080495X NAPA/GATES 25-080496HD As specified
CRC Industries 11 oz. QD Electronic
24 | Cleaner #5103 (CARB Compliant, must 30 5.84 175.20 9.69 290.70 10.99 329.70
meet California VOC requirements)
Brand and Model Offered: As specified CRC 09183 As specified
Lucas Oil Products 11 oz. Chain
o5 | Lubricant#10393 (CARB compliant, 25 5.28 132.00 9.99 249.75 10.99 274.75
must meet California VOC
requirements)
Brand and Model Offered: As specified As specified As specified
Valvoline Mercon V ATF Automatic
26 Transmission Fluid, 1 quart, #822345 35 4.82 168.70 8.69 304.15 7.99 279.65
Brand and Model Offered: MTC XT5QMC As specified As specified
Zerostart Starting Fluid 18 oz.,
27 #8200327 5 1.89 9.45 48.49 242.45 7117 355.85
Brand and Model Offered: FVP SF11 KATS HEATERS #33118 As specified
Gates FleetRunner Micro-V Serpentine
28 Belt, #K080645HD 10 21.19 211.90 26.76 267.60 29.86 298.60
Brand and Model Offered: CONTINENTAL 4080645 NAPA GATES 25-080645HD As specified
29 | WIXSTT40XE Ciﬁtrgge Transmission | 37.78 188.90 39.78 198.90 50.65 298.25
Brand and Model Offered: As specified NAPA 7740XE As specified
30 |WIX 33780 Sp'”'ofﬂt';e'/ water separator| 4, 18.56 185.60 19.54 195.40 29.30 293.00
Brand and Model Offered: As specified NAPA 3780 As specified
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Name of Firm
City/State

Contact Person
Telephone
Email

Procurement Cards?

Restocking Policy

Delivery Time

Retail Locations

Factory Motor Parts

Sacramento, CA
Dana Carney

720-251-1776

d.carney@fmpco.com

Yes

Stocking customers can return up to 12
months without the restocking fee -
after 12 months 15% fee

Auburn - 4 hours; Truckee - Next Day

Yes; Rocklin

Riebes Auto Parts
Auburn, CA

Paul Gerstle
916-251-5402

aul_gerstle@riebes.com

Yes

No Restocking Fee on regular stocking
items in resellable condition. There
could be a small restocking fee on

Special Orders depending on the
vendor the part was sourced from.

1 Hour

Yes; Auburn, Colfax, Rocklin, Loomis,
and Lincoln

O'Reilly Auto Parts
Springfield, MO

Roanen Barron
417-829-5879
probids@oreillyauto.com

Yes

No restocking fee for items returned
unused, undamaged, in original
packaging, and in resellable condition.
Otherwise a restocking fee of 20% may
apply at Store Manager's discretion.

Most in-stock items within 1 day, most
non-stock items within 1-2 days,
special/factory orders by appointments

Yes; Auburn, Rocklin, Roseville,
Lincoln

Discounts for Other Aftermarket Auto Parts? Yes - See Attached NO Yes
LVP Certified? (" No Yes No
Invoice Terms Net 30 2% Net 10 2% 10, Net 20
Item
No. Item Description Qty Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension
31 WIX 46477 Radial seal inner air filter 10 18.83 188.30 19.82 198.20 29.73 297.30
Brand and Model Offered: As specified NAPA 6477 As specified
BrakeBest Select Brake Rotor
32 #680026RGS 5 23.52 117.60 35.41 177.05 34.28 171.40
Brand and Model Offered: FVP 12165090 NAPA 48880026 As specified
Motorcraft Synthetic Transmission Fluid
33 Mercon LV 1 quart #MERCON LV 20 4.82 96.40 5.99 119.80 7.99 159.80
Brand and Model Offered: MTC XT10QLVC MOTORCRAFT XT10QLV As specified
Final Charge 1 Gallon Red 50/50
34 | Prediluted Coolant/Antifreeze #FC50/50| 2 8.46 126.90 14.76 22140 17.99 26985
Brand and Model Offered: FVP HDRED5050GAL PEAK #FINALPM As specified
35 |WD-40 Multi-purpose ubricant spray, 12| ) 3.90 78.00 5.99 119.80 6.99 139.80
oz., #49005
Brand and Model Offered: PENRAY 4516 WD40 49004 As specified
Thermo Tec Automotive Exhaust
36 Insulating Wrap 2" x 50, #7353958 5 NO BID 56.25 281.25 49.99 249.95
Brand and Model Offered: XXXXX NAPA 7353958 DES 010108
Hopkins Carrand Heavy Duty Bi-Level
37 Wash Brush Head 10", #93086 30 11.61 348.30 15.99 479.70 13.99 419.70
Brand and Model Offered: As specified As specified As specified
ag |Mac’s Powder CarWash Powder, 161b.| = g, 1.51 120.80 48.79 3,903.20 39.99 3,199.20
pail, #2616
Brand and Model Offered: FOX 125115 As specified AIK 12325P
Meguiar's Mirror Glaze Vinyl and Rubber
39 | Cleaner/Conditioner, 1 gallon container, 40 5.43 217.20 36.85 1,474.00 38.99 1,559.60
#M4001
Brand and Model Offered: SUPERCLEAN 06722 As specified As specified
0 Keeper 3" x 30" Vehicle Recovery Strap, 10 NO BID 48.49 484.90 NO BID
#89933
Brand and Model Offered: XXXXX As specified XXXXX
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Name of Firm
City/State

Contact Person
Telephone
Email

Procurement Cards?

Restocking Policy

Delivery Time

Retail Locations

Factory Motor Parts

Sacramento, CA
Dana Carney

720-251-1776

d.carney@fmpco.com

Yes

Stocking customers can return up to 12
months without the restocking fee -
after 12 months 15% fee

Auburn - 4 hours; Truckee - Next Day

Yes; Rocklin

Riebes Auto Parts
Auburn, CA

Paul Gerstle
916-251-5402

aul_gerstle@riebes.com

Yes

No Restocking Fee on regular stocking
items in resellable condition. There
could be a small restocking fee on

Special Orders depending on the
vendor the part was sourced from.

1 Hour

Yes; Auburn, Colfax, Rocklin, Loomis,
and Lincoln

O'Reilly Auto Parts
Springfield, MO

Roanen Barron
417-829-5879
probids@oreillyauto.com

Yes

No restocking fee for items returned
unused, undamaged, in original
packaging, and in resellable condition.
Otherwise a restocking fee of 20% may
apply at Store Manager's discretion.

Most in-stock items within 1 day, most
non-stock items within 1-2 days,
special/factory orders by appointments

Yes; Auburn, Rocklin, Roseville,
Lincoln

Discounts for Other Aftermarket Auto Parts? Yes - See Attached NO Yes
LVP Certified? ") No Yes No
Invoice Terms ® Net 30 2% Net 10 2% 10, Net 20
Item
No. Item Description Qty Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension
Sprayway Glass Cleaner, 20 oz can,
41 #SWO050, must meet California VOC 200 2.71 542.00 3.99 798.00 4.99 998.00
requirements
Brand and Model Offered: FVP GC19 As specified As specified
Balkamp Rubber Wheel Chock,
42 #7305648 20 11.30 226.00 9.99 199.80 8.99 179.80
Brand and Model Offered: FVP SRC As specified RHN 11930
Subtotal 16,125.35|Subtotal 26,797.05|Subtotal 32,423.15
(1) A 5% Local Vendor Preference is granted to those firms who [7.25% Sales Tax 1,169.09|7.25% Sales Tax 1,942.79(7.25% Sales Tax 2,350.68
file an LVP Affidavit with Procurement prior to the close of Freight 0.00|Freight 0.00|Freight 0.00
the bid. Bid Total 17,294.44/Bid Total 28,739.84|Bid Total 34,773.83
(2)  Invoice Terms of less than 10 days were not considered in  [LVP 0.00|LVP 1,436.99(LVP 0.00
this evaluation. Prompt Pay Disc 0.00{Prompt Pay Disc 574.80(Prompt Pay Disc 695.48
Ref. Price $17,294.44 |Ref. Price $26,728.05 |Ref. Price $34,078.35

EVALUATION NOTES:

EVALUATION SUMMARY - LISTED BY LOW RESPONSIVE BIDDER:
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Difference between second low bidder and low bidder:




