COU}I:\ITY

~Placer

Bid No.

Title:

20583
Grazing Services

Due Date: 2/27/2025 - 11:00 am

COUNTY OF PLACER, AUBURN, CA
BID TABULATION & NOTICE OF INTENT TO AWARD

(Intended award is highlighted)

Buyer Name/Phone:

April Pay

530-889-4253

BIDDERS:

Name of Bidder
City/State

Contact Person

Gregory Livestock Company
Sheridan CA

Steven Gregory

Golden State Goats LLC
Santa Maria CA

Clayton Hodges

Capra Environmental Services Corp
Roseville CA

Kara Richard

Goats R Us
Orinda CA

Terry Oyarzun

Telephone 916-899-9130 530-717-7377 279-203-7055 510-526-3337
LVP Certified? (" No No No No
Invoice Terms @ Net 30 25% down, Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
(1) A 5% Local Vendor Preference is granted to those firms who file an LVP Affidavit with Procurement prior to the close of the bid.
(2) Invoice Terms of less than 10 days cannot be considered in bid evaluations.
BID PRICING:
Group| Site Est. Grazing 1st Grazing 1st Grazing 1st Grazing 1st
No. No. Site Name Acreage Mob/Demob pass Total| Mob/Demob pass Total| Mob/Demob pass Total| Mob/Demob pass Total
Doyle Ranch AND Dry Creek Open Space

1 A  (combined into one line, per Addendum 2) 167.95 2,400.00 55,927.00 58,327.00 1,000.00 50,385.00 51,385.00 1,000.00 100,770.00 102,770.00 1,000.00 49,560.00 50,560.00

1 B  Dry Creek Open Space - combined with 1.A. 0 1,000.00
2 A Hidden Falls Regional Park 280 3,250.00 75,040.00 78,290.00 No Bid 1,000.00 168,000.00 169,000.00 1,000.00 79,800.00 80,800.00
3 A Freeway Cemetery 1 1,500.00 1,500.00 3,000.00 1,000.00 1,500.00 2,500.00 1,000.00 600.00 1,600.00 1,000.00 5,300.00 6,300.00
3 B PCGC Open Space 14.7 1,500.00 8,820.00 10,320.00 1,000.00 8,820.00 9,820.00 1,000.00 8,820.00 9,820.00 1,000.00 14,000.00 15,000.00
3 C PCGC Willow Creek Drive (area corrected per Ad| 4.61 1,500.00 2,766.00 4,266.00 1,000.00 1,000.00 2,000.00 1,000.00 2,766.00 3,766.00 1,000.00 5,520.00 6,520.00
3 D Twilight Ride 25 2,500.00 12,500.00 15,000.00 1,000.00 12,500.00 13,500.00 1,000.00 15,000.00 16,000.00 1,000.00 18,250.00 19,250.00
Subtotal 32,586.00 Subtotal 27,820.00 Subtotal 31,186.00 Subtotal 47,070.00
4 A Griffith Quarry 15 1,500.00 8,500.00 10,000.00 1,000.00 9,000.00 10,000.00 1,000.00 9,000.00 10,000.00 1,000.00 15,000.00 16,000.00
4 B  Traylor Ranch Nature Preserve 41.4 2,000.00 20,700.00 22,700.00 1,000.00 16,560.00 17,560.00 1,000.00 24,840.00 25,840.00 1,000.00 18,009.00 19,009.00
4 C Loomis Park South 6.8 500.00 3,400.00 3,900.00 1,000.00 4,760.00 5,760.00 1,000.00 4,080.00 5,080.00 1,000.00 7,480.00 8,480.00
4 D Loomis Landfill 20 2,000.00 12,000.00 14,000.00 1,000.00 12,000.00 13,000.00 1,000.00 12,000.00 13,000.00 1,000.00 14,600.00 15,600.00
Subtotal 50,600.00 Subtotal 46,320.00 Subtotal 53,920.00 Subtotal 59,089.00
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COUNTY
F

~Placer

Bid No.

Title:

20583
Grazing Services

Due Date: 2/27/2025-11:00 am

BIDDERS:

Name of Bidder
City/State

Contact Person

Leland F Hazeltine
Pleasant Grove CA

Leland Hazeltine

Blue Tent Farms LLC
Red Bluff CA

Timothy Arrowsmith

Blue Tent Farms - hard copy

Tim Arrowsmith

Legacy Ranching
Penn Valley CA

Rob Thompson

NM Ranch
Loomis CA

Kaitlyn Medlar

Telephone 530-681-0290 530-200-2929 530-200-2929 530-708-0590 916-835-1396
LVP Certified? ") No No No No Yes
1.5%-10, Net 30
For ltems 1 and 2:
Invoice Terms @ Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 "Progress billing every 2 weeks" Net 30
(1) A 5% Local Vendor Preference is granted to those firms whc
(2) Invoice Terms of less than 10 days cannot be considered in
BID PRICING:
Group| Site Est. Grazing 1st Grazing 1st Grazing 1st Grazing 1st Grazing 1st
No. No. Site Name Acreage | Mob/Demob pass Total| Mob/Demob pass Total| Mob/Demob pass Total| Mob/Demob pass Total| Mob/Demob pass Total
Doyle Ranch AND Dry Creek Open Space
1 (combined into one line, per Addendum 2) 167.95 3,000.00 51,000.00 54,000.00 0.00 9,600.00 67,170.00 REJECTED 3,000.00 58,200.00 61,200.00 2,400.00 97,426.00 99,826.00
1 B  Dry Creek Open Space - combined with 1.A. 0 1,000.00 56,570.00 Pymt Discount -918.00 Local Pref. -4,991.30
Net Total 60,282.00 Net Total 94,834.70
2 A Hidden Falls Regional Park 280 No Bid 1,000.00 153,000.00 154,000.00 5,000.00 105,000.00 110,000.00 4,000.00 161,760.00 165,760.00
Pymt Discount -1,650.00 Local Pref. -8,288.00
Net Total 108,350.00 Net Total 157,472.00
3 A Freeway Cemetery 1 No Bid 550.00 550.00 750.00 750.00 1,500.00 1,500.00 1,500.00 3,000.00
3 B PCGC Open Space 14.7 No Bid 1,000.00 7,085.00 8,085.00 2,000.00 9,025.00 11,025.00 2,000.00 9,642.00 11,642.00
3 C PCGC Willow Creek Drive (area corrected per Ad| 4.61 No Bid 550.00 550.00 1,000.00 3,370.00 4,370.00 2,000.00 3,800.00 5,800.00
3 D Twilight Ride 25 No Bid 1,000.00 12,750.00 13,750.00 7,000.00 4,250.00 11,250.00 10,000.00 5,000.00 15,000.00
Subtotal No Bid Subtotal 22,935.00 Subtotal 28,145.00 Subtotal Subtotal 35,442.00
Pymt Discount -422.18 Local Pref. -1,772.10
Net Total 27,722.83 Net Total 33,669.90
4 A Griffith Quarry 15 1,500.00 6,000.00 7,500.00 1,000.00 7,250.00 8,250.00 2,000.00 7,000.00 9,000.00 2,000.00 7,975.00 9,975.00
4 B  Traylor Ranch Nature Preserve 414 2,000.00 13,000.00 15,000.00 1,000.00 21,770.00 22,770.00 2,500.00 16,130.00 18,630.00 2,000.00 25,531.00 27,531.00
4 C Loomis Park South 6.8 1,000.00 4,000.00 5,000.00 1,000.00 2,740.00 3,740.00 0.00 3,400.00 3,400.00 1,520.00 3,002.00 4,522.00
4 D Loomis Landfill 20 2,000.00 10,000.00 12,000.00 1,000.00 10,000.00 11,000.00 2,000.00 8,000.00 10,000.00 2,000.00 11,300.00 13,300.00
Subtotal 39,500.00 Subtotal 45,760.00 Subtotal 41,030.00 Subtotal 55,328.00
Pymt Discount -615.45 Local Pref. -2,766.40
Net Total 40,414.55 Net Total 52,561.60
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BIDDERS: Name of Bidder Gregory Livestock Company Golden State Goats LLC Capra Environmental Services Corp (Goats R Us
City/State Sheridan CA Santa Maria CA Roseville CA Orinda CA
5 A Miners Ravine 9 2,000.00 8,000.00 10,000.00 1,000.00 5,400.00 6,400.00 1,000.00 5,400.00 6,400.00 1,000.00 9,900.00 10,900.00
5 B Los Lagos Parkway 20 2,000.00 12,000.00 14,000.00 1,000.00 10,000.00 11,000.00 1,000.00 12,000.00 13,000.00 1,000.00 14,600.00 15,600.00
5 C Sterling Pointe Equestrian Staging Area 4.5 1,500.00 4,500.00 6,000.00 1,000.00 3,150.00 4,150.00 1,000.00 2,700.00 3,700.00 1,000.00 5,400.00 6,400.00
5 D Granite Bay Park 7.3 1,500.00 7,300.00 8.800.00 1,000.00 5,110.00 6,110.00 1,000.00 4,380.00 5,380.00 1,000.00 8,030.00 9.030.00
Subtotal 38,800.00 Subtotal 27,660.00 Subtotal 28,480.00 Subtotal 41,930.00
6 A Todd Valley Pond 25 2,500.00 15,000.00 17,500.00 1,000.00 12,500.00 13,500.00 1,000.00 15,000.00 16,000.00 1,000.00 18,250.00 19,250.00
B Todd Valley Silverleaf Drive 8 2,500.00 7,500.00 10,000.00 3,000.00 6,400.00 9,400.00 1,000.00 4,800.00 5,800.00 1,000.00 8,800.00 9,800.00
C  Foresthill Landfill 42 2,000.00 4,200.00 6,200.00 3,000.00 3,500.00 6,500.00 1,000.00 2,520.00 3,520.00 1,000.00 5,040.00 6,040.00
Subtotal 33,700.00 Subtotal 29,400.00 Subtotal 25,;320-00 Subtotal 35,090.00
7 A Meadow Vista Landfill 8 2,000.00 8,000.00 10,000.00 3,000.00 6,400.00 9,400.00 1,000.00 4,800.00 5,800.00 1,000.00 8,800.00 9,800.00
Comments: Group 2 Rejected for Group 6 - Past poor Group 1
performance
AWARD SUMMARY:

Goats R Us Group 1 $50,560.00

Gregory Livestock Company Group 2 78,290.00

Blue Tent Farms LLC Group 3 &5 45,375.00

Leland F Hazeltine Group 4 39,500.00

Legacy Ranching Group6 & 7 31,840.00

BID TOTAL: $245,565.00
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BIDDERS: Name of Bidder Leland F Hazeltine Blue Tent Farms LLC Blue Tent Farms - hard copy Legacy Ranching NM Ranch

City/State Pleasant Grove CA Red Bluff CA Penn Valley CA Loomis CA
5 A Miners Ravine 9 1,000.00 8,000.00 9,000.00 1,000.00 3,950.00 4,950.00 1,500.00 6,600.00 8,100.00 2,000.00 5,578.00 7,578.00
5 B Los Lagos Parkway 20 2,000.00 12,000.00 14,000.00 1,000.00 10,000.00 11,000.00 2,000.00 16,000.00 18,000.00 2,000.00 14,840.00 16,840.00
5 C Sterling Pointe Equestrian Staging Area 45 1,000.00 4,000.00 5,000.00 1,000.00 1,475.00 2,475.00 1,000.00 3,500.00 4,500.00 2,000.00 2,250.00 4,250.00
5 D Granite Bay Park 7.3 1,000.00 6,000.00 7,000.00 1,000.00 3,015.00 4,015.00 1,500.00 5,800.00 7,300.00 2,000.00 4,147.00 6.147.00
Subtotal 35,000.00 Subtotal 22,440.00 Subtotal 37,900.00 Subtotal 34,815.00
Pymt Discount -568.50 Local Pref. -1,740.75
Net Total 37,331.50 Net Total 33,074.25
Todd Valley Pond 25 No Bid 1,000.00 17,750.00 18,750.00 2,500.00 13,750.00 16,250.00 2,000.00 11,847.00 13,847.00
B Todd Valley Silverleaf Drive 8 No Bid 1,000.00 5,000.00 6,000.00 2,000.00 4,800.00 6,800.00 3,000.00 7,656.00 10,656.00
Foresthill Landfill 4.2 No Bid 3,150.00 3,150.00 2,000.00 1,990.00 3,990.00 2,000.00 3,338.00 5,338.00
Subtotal No Bid Subtotal 27,900.00 Subtotal 27,040.00 Subtotal 29,841.00
Pymt Discount -405.60 Local Pref. -1,492.05
Net Total 26,634.40 Net Total 28,348.95
7 A Meadow Vista Landfill 8 No Bid 1,000.00 5,800.00 6,800.00 2,000.00 2,800.00 4,800.00 2,000.00 4,336.00 6,336.00
Pymt Discount -72.00 Local Pref. -316.80
Net Total 4,728.00 Net Total 6,019.20

Comments: Group 4 Group 3 and 5 REJECTED IN ITS ENTIRETY Group 6 and 7

- Did not provide lump sum price for
Grazing - 1st Pass

- Did not provide any price for
Grazing - 2nd Pass (assume it is No
Charge)

- Did not submit the updated/revised
Bid Form provided with Addendum 2

AWARD SUMMARY:

Goats R Us

Gregory Livestock Company
Blue Tent Farms LLC
Leland F Hazeltine

Legacy Ranching
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