COUNTY OF PLACER, AUBURN, CA
BID TABULATION - LINE ITEM EVALUATION

Bid No. 20106 Buyer Name/Phone: Jon Manning 530-889-4242

Title: Personal Protective Equipment and Supplies (COVID-19)
Due Date: 8/3/2020 @ 3:00:00 PM (Pacific) (Recommended award is highlighted)

BID LINE ITEM: A.1 - FACE SHIELD

BIDDERS: Extended Amount Prompt Payment Discount Total Bid Amount Notes

Legend Medical Consulting
Group A1

Reject this bid due to the bidder's requirement of a wire transfer with
30% down payment for the order.

Reject this bid due to the bidder not submitting a specification sheet for

Zendy Inc. A1 their offered alternate product ( 4 of A)
Gnomedica LLC A1 $8,016.00 $0.00 $8,016.00 Offered alternate, submitted alternate specifications
Bay Promo, LLC A1 $8,183.00 $0.00 $8,183.00 Offered alternate, submitted alternate specifications
Source Point Products &

Services A $10,020.00 $0.00 $10,020.00 Offered alternate, submitted .jpg file that cannot be opened
Gutierrez Goods A1 $11,523.00 $0.00 $11,523.00
Sunwest Group of Companies  A.1 $12,525.00 $125.25 $12,399.75
International Promotional Ideas

Inc A1 $12,525.00 $0.00 $12,525.00
US Health Express Corp A1 $13,360.00 $0.00 $13,360.00
MCT Pro Tools Inc A1 $13,360.00 $0.00 $13,360.00
Green Dream International LLC A.1 $13,527.00 $0.00 $13,527.00
lonized Consulting LLC A1 $14,195.00 $0.00 $14,195.00
Unipak Corp. A1 $14,696.00 $0.00 $14,696.00
Aviationy LLC A1 $14,863.00 $0.00 $14,863.00
Premium Contractor Solution

LLC A1 $15,030.00 $0.00 $15,030.00
LevelOne Group, LLC A1 $15,865.00 $317.30 $15,547.70
NDS Solutions, Inc. A1 $15,698.00 $0.00 $15,698.00
Digital Gadgets Medical LLC A1 $15,865.00 $0.00 $15,865.00
Brandit Corporation AA $16,032.00 $0.00 $16,032.00
Mo' Money Associates A1 $16,366.00 $0.00 $16,366.00
Trans Terra Technologies LLC  A.1 $16,700.00 $334.00 $16,366.00
Aiden, Inc. AA $16,700.00 $167.00 $16,533.00
Private Equity Funding, Inc A1 $16,700.00 $0.00 $16,700.00
Omni Distributors LLC AA $16,700.00 $0.00 $16,700.00
Authentic Medical A1 $17,201.00 $0.00 $17,201.00
Adaptive Energy AA $17,702.00 $0.00 $17,702.00
Steuber Corporation A1 $18,370.00 $0.00 $18,370.00
Newport Pacific Trading A1 $19,205.00 $0.00 $19,205.00
Soho Apparel Group Inc AA $20,040.00 $0.00 $20,040.00
ProLogic ITS, LLC AA $21,209.00 $0.00 $21,209.00
International Consulting Unitd ~ A.1 $21,710.00 $0.00 $21,710.00
Aviate Enterprises, Inc. A1 $22,545.00 $0.00 $22,545.00
D D Office Products Inc A1 $24,215.00 $0.00 $24,215.00
IMAKE SOLUTIONS INC AA $24,883.00 $0.00 $24,883.00
Pristine Dental Supplies Inc. AA $25,050.00 $0.00 $25,050.00
Amheart Solutions A1 $25,050.00 $0.00 $25,050.00
Ventura & Associates, Inc. A1 $25,551.00 $0.00 $25,551.00
Texas Medical Center Supply

LLC A1 $26,553.00 $531.06 $26,021.94
Valet Press LLC A1 $28,390.00 $283.90 $28,106.10
Jam'n Products Inc. A1 $30,060.00 $0.00 $30,060.00
Uweport LLC A1 $30,060.00 $0.00 $30,060.00
Coyle Reproductions, Inc. A1 $30,928.40 $618.57 $30,309.83
GALLS LLC A1 $31,883.64 $0.00 $31,883.64
Primera Plastics Inc. A1 $32,064.00 $0.00 $32,064.00
Ahava Life, LLC A1 $32,565.00 $0.00 $32,565.00
Omnibus Trading Corporation ~ A.1 $33,400.00 $334.00 $33,066.00
Performance Safety Group I, LP A.1 $33,233.00 $0.00 $33,233.00
Medical Shipment LLC A1 $33,233.00 $0.00 $33,233.00
D's Ventures, LLC dba LogMet

Solutions AA $33,400.00 $0.00 $33,400.00
W.S. Darley & Co. A1 $36,406.00 $0.00 $36,406.00
Gentox Medical Services, LLC A.1 $38,410.00 $0.00 $38,410.00
Premium Rx National, LLC A1 $39,078.00 $0.00 $39,078.00
Federal Eastern International,

LLC A1 $39,245.00 $0.00 $39,245.00
Universal Presentation

Concepts A1 $39,245.00 $0.00 $39,245.00
Mallory Safety and Supply, LLC A.1 $41,249.00 $0.00 $41,249.00
Fastenal Company AA $46,760.00 $935.20 $45,824.80
Mark One Manufacturing LTD A1 $45,925.00 $0.00 $45,925.00
Radiology Oncology Systems ~ A.1 $45,925.00 $0.00 $45,925.00
Matheson Tri-Gas A1 $46,567.95 $0.00 $46,567.95
Imagine Medical International ~ A.1 $46,760.00 $0.00 $46,760.00
Lacote Supply, Inc. A1 $46,760.00 $0.00 $46,760.00

ACCUSCIENCE A1 $48,430.00 $0.00 $48,430.00



COUNTY OF PLACER, AUBURN, CA
BID TABULATION - LINE ITEM EVALUATION

Bid No. 20106 Buyer Name/Phone: Jon Manning 530-889-4242
Title: Personal Protective Equipment and Supplies (COVID-19)
Due Date: 8/3/2020 @ 3:00:00 PM (Pacific) (Recommended award is highlighted)

BID LINE ITEM: A.1 - FACE SHIELD

BIDDERS: Extended Amount Prompt Payment Discount Total Bid Amount Notes
Nationwide Medical Surgical Inc A.1 $50,100.00 $501.00 $49,599.00
Dumont Printing AA $49,933.00 $0.00 $49,933.00
Garrett One Enterprises, Inc.  A.1 $50,100.00 $0.00 $50,100.00
Melrose Nameplate and Label

Co. AA $50,968.40 $0.00 $50,968.40
Ashen Lights Holdings Inc. A1 $53,440.00 $0.00 $53,440.00
Anchorage Medical Equipment

& Supplies, LLC AA $58,450.00 $1,169.00 $57,281.00
BSN Sports, LLC A1 $58,450.00 $0.00 $58,450.00
McKesson Medical-Surgical

Government Solutions LLC A1 $59,619.00 $0.00 $59,619.00
Professional Training Institute,

Inc. AA $63,460.00 $3,173.00 $60,287.00
MD PPE LLC A1 $60,955.00 $0.00 $60,955.00
Wilsons Uniforms Inc AA $65,965.00 $0.00 $65,965.00
Conversions Technology AA $81,663.00 $0.00 $81,663.00
Bridgewater Studio AA $83,166.00 $0.00 $83,166.00
R.S. Hughes Co., Inc. AA $83,333.00 $0.00 $83,333.00
Perdue Inc AA $225,450.00 $11,272.50 $214,177.50
Charter Trading Corporation A1 No Bid No Bid No Bid
ProcureNet America A1 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Ace Uniforms LLC A1 No Bid No Bid No Bid
PLX Industries, Inc. A1 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Modernmart, Inc A1 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Longbow Holdings, LLC A1 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Aramark Uniform Services A1 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Rocket Distributors LLC A1 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Venus Group Inc A1 No Bid No Bid No Bid
BBWD Farming, LLC AA No Bid No Bid No Bid
Red Phoenix Manufacturing

Inc. AA No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cartagena Sun A1 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Apparel Trading International,

Inc. A1 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Spicers Paper A1 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Magtec Corporation A1 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bound Tree Medical A1 No Bid No Bid No Bid
US-VN-Myanmar Rare Earth

Elements Group, Corporation ~ A.1 No Bid No Bid No Bid
AIPC Global Inc A1 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Global Imports Express, LLC A1 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Precision Medical Products Inc. A.1 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Blackpoint Distribution A1 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Watchtower Supplies Inc. A1 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Hanesbrands Inc. A1 No Bid No Bid No Bid



COUNTY OF PLACER, AUBURN, CA
BID TABULATION - LINE ITEM EVALUATION

Bid No. 20106 Buyer Name/Phone: Jon Manning 530-889-4242
Title: Personal Protective Equipment and Supplies (COVID-19)
Due Date: 8/3/2020 @ 3:00:00 PM (Pacific) (Recommended award is highlighted)

BID LINE ITEM: A.2 - FACE MASK

BIDDERS: Extended Amount  Prompt Payment Discount  Total Bid Amount Notes

Reject this bid due to the bidder's requirement of a wire transfer with

Legend Medical Consulting Group ~ A.2 30% down payment for the order.
MCT Pro Tools Inc A2 $1,670.00 $0.00 $1,670.00 Offered alternate, submitted alternate specifications
Bay Promo, LLC A2 $1,670.00 $0.00 $1,670.00 Offered alternate, submitted alternate specifications
Premium Contractor Solution LLC ~ A.2 $1,753.50 $0.00 $1,753.50 Offered alternate, submitted alternate specifications
Trans Terra Technologies LLC A2 $1,837.00 $36.74 $1,800.26 Offered alternate, submitted alternate specifications
Gnomedica LLC A2 $1,970.60 $0.00 $1,970.60
Aiden, Inc. A2 $2,004.00 $20.04 $1,983.96
Green Dream International LLC A2 $2,004.00 $0.00 $2,004.00
Zendy Inc. A2 $2,154.30 $43.09 $2,111.21
Garrett One Enterprises, Inc. A2 $2,171.00 $0.00 $2,171.00
Aviationy LLC A2 $2,254.50 $0.00 $2,254.50
D D Office Products Inc A2 $2,338.00 $0.00 $2,338.00
Private Equity Funding, Inc A2 $2,338.00 $0.00 $2,338.00
AIPC Global Inc A2 $2,338.00 $0.00 $2,338.00
Nationwide Medical Surgical Inc A2 $2,505.00 $25.05 $2,479.95
Sunwest Group of Companies A2 $2,505.00 $25.05 $2,479.95
IMAKE SOLUTIONS INC A2 $2,505.00 $0.00 $2,505.00
LevelOne Group, LLC A2 $2,672.00 $53.44 $2,618.56
Pristine Dental Supplies Inc. A2 $2,672.00 $0.00 $2,672.00
US Health Express Corp A2 $2,672.00 $0.00 $2,672.00
NDS Solutions, Inc. A2 $2,672.00 $0.00 $2,672.00
Charter Trading Corporation A2 $3,006.00 $0.00 $3,006.00
Gutierrez Goods A2 $3,006.00 $0.00 $3,006.00
Soho Apparel Group Inc A2 $3,006.00 $0.00 $3,006.00
Digital Gadgets Medical LLC A2 $3,006.00 $0.00 $3,006.00
Perdue Inc A2 $3,173.00 $158.65 $3,014.35
lonized Consulting LLC A2 $3,173.00 $0.00 $3,173.00
Steuber Corporation A2 $3,173.00 $0.00 $3,173.00
Aviate Enterprises, Inc. A2 $3,173.00 $0.00 $3,173.00
Texas Medical Center Supply LLC A.2 $3,340.00 $66.80 $3,273.20
ACCUSCIENCE A2 $3,340.00 $0.00 $3,340.00
Ambheart Solutions A2 $3,340.00 $0.00 $3,340.00
International Promotional Ideas Inc  A.2 $3,340.00 $0.00 $3,340.00
W.S. Darley & Co. A2 $3,507.00 $0.00 $3,507.00
Global Imports Express, LLC A2 $3,507.00 $0.00 $3,507.00
Imagine Medical International A2 $3,674.00 $0.00 $3,674.00
Jam'n Products Inc. A2 $3,674.00 $0.00 $3,674.00
Precision Medical Products Inc. A2 $3,674.00 $0.00 $3,674.00
Ahava Life, LLC A2 $3,757.50 $0.00 $3,757.50
GALLS LLC A2 $3,779.21 $0.00 $3,779.21
Omnibus Trading Corporation A2 $3,841.00 $38.41 $3,802.59
Cartagena Sun A2 $3,841.00 $0.00 $3,841.00
International Consulting Unit'd A2 $4,008.00 $0.00 $4,008.00
Newport Pacific Trading A2 $4,008.00 $0.00 $4,008.00
Premium Rx National, LLC A2 $4,008.00 $0.00 $4,008.00
Uweport LLC A2 $4,175.00 $0.00 $4,175.00
Magtec Corporation A2 $4,175.00 $0.00 $4,175.00
Radiology Oncology Systems A2 $4,342.00 $0.00 $4,342.00
Lacote Supply, Inc. A2 $4,342.00 $0.00 $4,342.00
Ventura & Associates, Inc. A2 $4,676.00 $0.00 $4,676.00
Federal Eastern International, LLC  A.2 $4,843.00 $0.00 $4,843.00
Conversions Technology A2 $4,926.50 $0.00 $4,926.50
Valet Press LLC A2 $5,010.00 $50.10 $4,959.90
Gentox Medical Services, LLC A2 $5,010.00 $0.00 $5,010.00
Matheson Tri-Gas A2 $5,811.60 $0.00 $5,811.60
Wilsons Uniforms Inc A2 $5,845.00 $0.00 $5,845.00
Authentic Medical A2 $6,012.00 $0.00 $6,012.00
Mallory Safety and Supply, LLC ~ A.2 $6,179.00 $0.00 $6,179.00
Fastenal Company A2 $6,680.00 $133.60 $6,546.40
Venus Group Inc A2 $6,680.00 $66.80 $6,613.20
Ashen Lights Holdings Inc. A2 $6,680.00 $0.00 $6,680.00
Professional Training Institute, Inc. A.2 $7,181.00 $359.05 $6,821.95
Longbow Holdings, LLC A2 $6,847.00 $0.00 $6,847.00
Brandit Corporation A2 $7,014.00 $0.00 $7,014.00
ProLogic ITS, LLC A2 $7,014.00 $0.00 $7,014.00
Supplies, LLC A2 $8,183.00 $163.66 $8,019.34
Spicers Paper A2 $8,350.00 $83.50 $8,266.50
Source Point Products & Services A.2 $8,350.00 $0.00 $8,350.00
BSN Sports, LLC A2 $8,350.00 $0.00 $8,350.00
Government Solutions LLC A2 $8,684.00 $0.00 $8,684.00
Ace Uniforms LLC A2 $8,851.00 $0.00 $8,851.00
R.S. Hughes Co., Inc. A2 $9,477.25 $0.00 $9,477.25
Red Phoenix Manufacturing Inc. A2 $10,020.00 $0.00 $10,020.00
Aramark Uniform Services A2 $10,187.00 $0.00 $10,187.00
Medical Shipment LLC A2 $11,523.00 $0.00 $11,523.00
Performance Safety Group |, LP A2 $16,533.00 $0.00 $16,533.00
BBWD Farming, LLC A2 $25,050.00 $0.00 $25,050.00
Unipak Corp. A2 $108,550.00 $0.00 $108,550.00
MD PPE LLC A2 No Bid No Bid No Bid
ProcureNet America A2 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Mark One Manufacturing LTD A2 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Adaptive Energy A2 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Coyle Reproductions, Inc. A2 No Bid No Bid No Bid
PLX Industries, Inc. A2 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Primera Plastics Inc. A2 No Bid No Bid No Bid



COUNTY OF PLACER, AUBURN, CA
BID TABULATION - LINE ITEM EVALUATION

Bid No. 20106 Buyer Name/Phone: Jon Manning 530-889-4242

Title: Personal Protective Equipment and Supplies (COVID-19)

Due Date: 8/3/2020 @ 3:00:00 PM (Pacific) (Recommended award is highlighted)
BID LINE ITEM: A.2 - FACE MASK

BIDDERS: Extended Amount  Prompt Payment Discount  Total Bid Amount Notes

Modernmart, Inc A2 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Mo' Money Associates A2 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Rocket Distributors LLC A2 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Omni Distributors LLC A2 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bridgewater Studio A2 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Apparel Trading International, Inc. A.2 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Dumont Printing A2 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bound Tree Medical A2 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Elements Group, Corporation A2 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Solutions A2 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Universal Presentation Concepts A2 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Melrose Nameplate and Label Co. A.2 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Blackpoint Distribution A2 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Watchtower Supplies Inc. A2 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Hanesbrands Inc. A2 No Bid No Bid No Bid



Bid No.
Title:
Due Date:
BID LINE ITEM:
BIDDERS:
Aiden, Inc. A3

Garrett One Enterprises, Inc.
MCT Pro Tools Inc

Private Equity Funding, Inc

Sunwest Group of Companies

Perdue Inc

R.S. Hughes Co., Inc.

Pristine Dental Supplies Inc.
Valet Press LLC

Conversions Technology

Soho Apparel Group Inc

AIPC Global Inc

Solutions

Radiology Oncology Systems
Professional Training Institute, Inc.
Texas Medical Center Supply LLC
Green Dream International LLC
International Consulting Unlt'd
Ace Uniforms LLC

Fastenal Company

Supplies, LLC

Gentox Medical Services, LLC
US Health Express Corp
Wilsons Uniforms Inc

Digital Gadgets Medical LLC
International Promotional Ideas Inc
IMAKE SOLUTIONS INC
Brandit Corporation

Ventura & Associates, Inc.

NDS Solutions, Inc.

Source Point Products & Services
Charter Trading Corporation
MD PPE LLC

ProcureNet America
Performance Safety Group I, LP
ACCUSCIENCE

Mark One Manufacturing LTD
Gutierrez Goods

Federal Eastern International, LLC
Adaptive Energy

D D Office Products Inc

Coyle Reproductions, Inc.
Nationwide Medical Surgical Inc
PLX Industries, Inc.

Ashen Lights Holdings Inc.
Primera Plastics Inc.

Newport Pacific Trading
Gnomedica LLC

Imagine Medical International
Modernmart, Inc

Government Solutions LLC

Mo' Money Associates

Longbow Holdings, LLC

W.S. Darley & Co.

BSN Sports, LLC

Aramark Uniform Services
Trans Terra Technologies LLC
Lacote Supply, Inc.

Aviationy LLC

Jam'n Products Inc.

Uweport LLC

Rocket Distributors LLC

lonized Consulting LLC

Omni Distributors LLC

Premium Contractor Solution LLC
Venus Group Inc

BBWD Farming, LLC
Bridgewater Studio

Red Phoenix Manufacturing Inc.

A3
A3

A3

A3

A3

COUNTY OF PLACER, AUBURN, CA
BID TABULATION - LINE ITEM EVALUATION

20106
Personal Protective Equipment and Supplies (COVID-19)
8/3/2020 @ 3:00:00 PM (Pacific)

Buyer Name/Phone: Jon Manning

(Recommended award is highlighted)
A.3 - EXAM GLOVES

Total Bid Amount

Extended Amount

Prompt Payment Discount Notes

Reject bid due to the bidder not submitting a specification sheet
for their offered alternate product (reference Section 4 of Attachment A)

Reject this bid due to the bidder not submitting a specification sheet
for their offered alternate product (reference Section 4 of Attachment A)
Offered alternate, submitted alternate specifications

$1,428.00 $1,428.00

$1,512.00 $0.00 $1,512.00
$1,678.32 $16.78 $1,661.54
$1,932.00 $96.60 $1,835.40
$2,016.00 $0.00 $2,016.00
$2,016.00 $0.00 $2,016.00 Offered alternate, submitted .jpg file that cannot be opened
$2,058.00 $20.58 $2,037.42
$2,100.00 $0.00 $2,100.00
$2,100.00 $0.00 $2,100.00
$2,142.00 $0.00 $2,142.00
$2,184.00 $0.00 $2,184.00
$2,232.72 $0.00 $2,232.72
$2,385.60 $119.28 $2,266.32
$2,394.00 $47.88 $2,346.12
$2,352.00 $0.00 $2,352.00
$2,478.00 $0.00 $2,478.00
$2,686.32 $0.00 $2,686.32
$2,940.00 $58.80 $2,881.20
$3,024.00 $60.48 $2,963.52
$3,551.52 $0.00 $3,551.52
$3,780.00 $0.00 $3,780.00
$4,191.60 $0.00 $4,191.60
$4,200.00 $0.00 $4,200.00
$4,200.00 $0.00 $4,200.00
$4,536.00 $0.00 $4,536.00
$4,872.00 $0.00 $4,872.00
$5,342.40 $0.00 $5,342.40
$9,744.00 $0.00 $9,744.00
$11,760.00 $0.00 $11,760.00
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid

530-889-4242



COUNTY OF PLACER, AUBURN, CA
BID TABULATION - LINE ITEM EVALUATION

20106 Buyer Name/Phone: Jon Manning 530-889-4242
Personal Protective Equipment and Supplies (COVID-19)
8/3/2020 @ 3:00:00 PM (Pacific) (Recommended award is highlighted)

BID LINE ITEM: A.3 - EXAM GLOVES

BIDDERS: Extended Amount Prompt Payment Discount Total Bid Amount Notes
Amheart Solutions A3 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Unipak Corp. A3 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Premium Rx National, LLC A3 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Steuber Corporation A3 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cartagena Sun A3 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Apparel Trading International, Inc. A3 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Dumont Printing A3 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Legend Medical Consulting Group  A.3 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Spicers Paper A3 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Magtec Corporation A3 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Matheson Tri-Gas A3 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bound Tree Medical A3 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Elements Group, Corporation A3 No Bid No Bid No Bid
LevelOne Group, LLC A3 No Bid No Bid No Bid
ProLogic ITS, LLC A3 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Authentic Medical A3 No Bid No Bid No Bid
GALLS LLC A3 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Universal Presentation Concepts A3 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Aviate Enterprises, Inc. A3 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Mallory Safety and Supply, LLC A3 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Omnibus Trading Corporation A3 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bay Promo, LLC A.3 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Melrose Nameplate and Label Co. A.3 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Medical Shipment LLC A3 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Ahava Life, LLC A3 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Zendy Inc. A3 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Global Imports Express, LLC A3 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Precision Medical Products Inc. A3 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Blackpoint Distribution A3 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Watchtower Supplies Inc. A3 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Hanesbrands Inc. A3 No Bid No Bid No Bid



COUNTY OF PLACER, AUBURN, CA
BID TABULATION - LINE ITEM EVALUATION

20106 Buyer Name/Phone: Jon Manning 530-889-4242
Personal Protective Equipment and Supplies (COVID-19)
8/3/2020 @ 3:00:00 PM (Pacific) (Recommended award is highlighted)

BID LINE ITEM: A.4 - WIPES

BIDDERS: Extended Amount Prompt Payment Discount Total Bid Amount Notes

Reject this bid because bidder's offered alternate product failed to meet

Green Dream International LLC A4 minimum specifications - the alternate product is not on EPA List N.
Gentox Medical Services, LLC A4 $3,726.78 $0.00 $3,726.78 Offered alternate, submitted alternate specifications
BSN Sports, LLC A4 $3,858.64 $0.00 $3,858.64
Soho Apparel Group Inc A4 $4,150.12 $0.00 $4,150.12
Uweport LLC A4 $4,150.12 $0.00 $4,150.12 Offered alternate, submitted alternate specifications
Source Point Products & Services A4 $4,788.60 $0.00 $4,788.60
Steuber Corporation A4 $4,892.70 $0.00 $4,892.70
Aviate Enterprises, Inc. A4 $5,198.06 $0.00 $5,198.06
Conversions Technology A4 $5,475.66 $0.00 $5,475.66
Medical Shipment LLC A4 $6,239.06 $0.00 $6,239.06
Private Equity Funding, Inc A4 $6,246.00 $0.00 $6,246.00
Texas Medical Center Supply LLC A4 $6,940.00 $138.80 $6,801.20
lonized Consulting LLC A4 $6,933.06 $0.00 $6,933.06
Digital Gadgets Medical LLC A4 $7,807.50 $0.00 $7,807.50
Mo' Money Associates A4 $8,432.10 $0.00 $8,432.10
Nationwide Medical Surgical Inc A4 $9,195.50 $91.96 $9,103.55
NDS Solutions, Inc. A4 $9,160.80 $0.00 $9,160.80
International Promotional Ideas Inc  A.4 $10,410.00 $0.00 $10,410.00
Valet Press LLC A4 $10,604.32 $106.04 $10,498.28
GALLS LLC A4 $11,435.39 $0.00 $11,435.39
Brandit Corporation A4 $11,971.50 $0.00 $11,971.50
Wilsons Uniforms Inc A4 $13,179.06 $0.00 $13,179.06
Pristine Dental Supplies Inc. A4 $13,873.06 $0.00 $13,873.06
Ashen Lights Holdings Inc. A4 $19,432.00 $0.00 $19,432.00
Professional Training Institute, Inc.  A.4 $23,179.60 $1,158.98 $22,020.62
ACCUSCIENCE A4 $22,208.00 $0.00 $22,208.00
Perdue Inc A4 $24,290.00 $1,214.50 $23,075.50
ProLogic ITS, LLC A4 $26,934.14 $0.00 $26,934.14
IMAKE SOLUTIONS INC A4 $37,302.50 $0.00 $37,302.50
R.S. Hughes Co., Inc. A4 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Charter Trading Corporation A4 No Bid No Bid No Bid
MD PPE LLC A4 No Bid No Bid No Bid
ProcureNet America A4 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Ventura & Associates, Inc. A4 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Ace Uniforms LLC A4 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Performance Safety Group I, LP A4 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Mark One Manufacturing LTD A4 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Gutierrez Goods A4 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Federal Eastern International, LLC A4 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Adaptive Energy A4 No Bid No Bid No Bid
D D Office Products Inc A4 No Bid No Bid No Bid
International Consulting Unlt'd A4 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Coyle Reproductions, Inc. A4 No Bid No Bid No Bid
PLX Industries, Inc. A4 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Garrett One Enterprises, Inc. A4 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Primera Plastics Inc. A4 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Newport Pacific Trading A4 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Radiology Oncology Systems A4 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Gnomedica LLC A4 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Imagine Medical International A4 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Modernmart, Inc A4 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Government Solutions LLC A4 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Longbow Holdings, LLC A4 No Bid No Bid No Bid
W.S. Darley & Co. A4 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Aramark Uniform Services A4 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Trans Terra Technologies LLC A4 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Lacote Supply, Inc. A4 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Aviationy LLC A4 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Jam'n Products Inc. A4 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Rocket Distributors LLC A4 No Bid No Bid No Bid
US Health Express Corp A4 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sunwest Group of Companies A4 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Omni Distributors LLC A4 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Premium Contractor Solution LLC A4 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Venus Group Inc A4 No Bid No Bid No Bid
BBWD Farming, LLC A4 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bridgewater Studio A4 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Red Phoenix Manufacturing Inc. A4 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Ambheart Solutions A4 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Unipak Corp. A4 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Premium Rx National, LLC A4 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cartagena Sun A4 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Apparel Trading International, Inc. A4 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Dumont Printing A4 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Supplies, LLC A4 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Legend Medical Consulting Group A4 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Spicers Paper A4 No Bid No Bid No Bid



COUNTY OF PLACER, AUBURN, CA
BID TABULATION - LINE ITEM EVALUATION

Bid No. 20106 Buyer Name/Phone: Jon Manning 530-889-4242
Title: Personal Protective Equipment and Supplies (COVID-19)
Due Date: 8/3/2020 @ 3:00:00 PM (Pacific) (Recommended award is highlighted)

BID LINE ITEM: A.4 - WIPES

BIDDERS: Extended Amount Prompt Payment Discount Total Bid Amount Notes
Magtec Corporation A4 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Matheson Tri-Gas A4 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Aiden, Inc. A4 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bound Tree Medical A4 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Elements Group, Corporation A4 No Bid No Bid No Bid
LevelOne Group, LLC A4 No Bid No Bid No Bid
AIPC Global Inc A4 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Authentic Medical A4 No Bid No Bid No Bid
MCT Pro Tools Inc A4 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Solutions A4 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Universal Presentation Concepts A4 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Fastenal Company A4 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Mallory Safety and Supply, LLC A4 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Omnibus Trading Corporation A4 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bay Promo, LLC A4 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Melrose Nameplate and Label Co. A4 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Ahava Life, LLC A4 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Zendy Inc. A4 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Global Imports Express, LLC A4 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Precision Medical Products Inc. A4 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Blackpoint Distribution A4 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Watchtower Supplies Inc. A4 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Hanesbrands Inc. A4 No Bid No Bid No Bid



